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• Stock markets positive with S&P Futures down, government bond yields
and USD up, with investors analyzing corporate earnings results and
preparing for a sale of 30-year US Treasury bond, which will show their
appetite and would give further insight into the upcoming rate cuts by the
Federal Reserve

• Attention will focus on Banxico's monetary policy decision where we
expect the central bank will leave the reference rate unchanged at 11.25%,
signaling that cuts are just around the corner. Likewise, the central bank of
Peru is going to announce its decision where the consensus anticipates a
25bp cut in its reference rate

• Markets will also focus on comments from Fed's Barkin. Treasury
Secretary, Janet Yellen, will appear before the Senate Banking Committee

• Regarding economic figures, the initial jobless claims will be published in
the US for the week ending February 3

• In Brazil, January inflation was 0.42% m/m above the consensus estimate
(0.34% m/m). With this, the annual variation stood at 4.51% from the
previous 4.62%, remaining within the central bank's tolerance range

• In Mexico, INEGI published January’s inflation at 0.89% m/m, with the core
at 0.40%. As such, annual inflation climbed to 4.88% (previous: 4.66%),
with the core lower at 4.76% (previous: 5.09%)
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• HR Ratings affirmed SICREA's ratings at 'HR A-' with Stable Outlook and

'HR2'. According to the agency, the ratification is based on the Company's

high solvency position, which showed a capitalization ratio of 77.9% as of

3Q23 (vs. 69.4% as of 3Q22 and 65.0% in the baseline scenario). The

strengthening of the solvency profile is attributed to both a lower portfolio

origination and the strengthening of its stockholders' equity through

earnings

• S&P Global Ratings assigned 'mxAAA' ratings to FEFA's proposed notes,

FEFA 24 / 24S, for up to MXN 6 billion. According to the agency, the ratings

reflect its expectation that the fund will continue to be the government's

main arm for developing the agricultural sector and a high probability of

extraordinary government support

• Negative performance in sovereign bonds. 10-year European rates adjust

up to +4bps. Meanwhile, Treasuries' curve loses 2bps. Yesterday, Mbonos'

curve registered a steepening bias with gains of 4bps at the short- and mid-

end, while the long-end adjusted +3bps

• The dollar advances, causing the developed currencies to trade in negative

domain with JPY (-0.7%) leading the losses. In EM, the bias is also negative

with THB (-0.6%) as the weakest. The MXN depreciates 0.2% trading at

17.08 per dollar, after losing 0.1% yesterday

• Crude-oil futures gain 1.0%, while their implied volatility is at its lowest

level since October. In this regard, futures have traded in a range of 10

$/bbl due to a lack of direction. Metals trade with negative bias highlighting

palladium (-2.2%) and gold (-0.5%)

• Mixed performances in the stock markets as investors weigh the latest 
corporate reports. US futures anticipate a slight decline with the S&P500 
and Nasdaq trading 0.1% below their theoretical value. Awaiting Ac's results 
in Mexico

• Disney (+7.7% in pre-market) reported yesterday better-than-expected 
earnings guidance and a 50% increase in the dividend. Arm (+26.1%) also 
surprised positively with optimistic earnings guidance. Today, 31 S&P500 
companies are expected to report results, including Philip Morris and 
Expedia

• In Mexico, Cemex reported EBITDA growth of 17.9% y/y, slightly below 
expectations. Details standing out include that cash flow doubled, leverage 
improved and will propose a dividend payout program (yield ~1.0%). 
Guidance on EBITDA 2024e anticipates low to mid-single digit advance, 
which should be neutral for the stock

Source: Bloomberg and Banorte. (P) preliminary data; (R) revised data; (F) final data; * Seasonally adjusted, ** Seasonally
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